



Bid Tabulation

August 27, 2019

Fayetteville Regional Airport - Airline Terminal Improvements - Part 2

Owner: City of Fayetteville

I certify that the bids represented herein (with exceptions noted) were properly submitted in accordance with requirements of the General Statutes of North Carolina, G.S. 143-128.



General Contractor	Addenda 1-4	Required Forms	Bid Security	Base Bid	Add Alt. # 1	Add Alt. # 2	Add Alt. # 3	Add Alt. # 4	Add Alt. # 5	Add Alt. # 6	Unit Price A-1	Unit Price A-2
					Conc. B Elevator	Belts @ Bag Claim	Auto Exit @ TSA	Property Ins.	W.V. Emission Control	Decorative Fencing	Unsuitable Soil / CY	Undercut/replace w/ stone / CY
Daniels & Daniels Const. Co.	✓	✓	✓	\$31,600,000.00	\$480,000.00	\$875,000.00	\$375,000.00	\$52,000.00	\$58,000.00	\$87,000.00	\$65.00	\$105.00
Mechanical Contractor:	Ivey Mechanical		\$4,200,000.00									
Plumbing Contractor:	Ivey Mechanical		\$1,570,000.00									
Electrical Contractor:	M-R Electric		\$3,258,000.00									
Fire Protection Contractor:	VSC		\$470,000.00									
Site Contractor:	Daniels & Daniels Construction Co.		\$2,000,000.00									
The Resolute Building Company	✓	✓	✓	\$26,268,300.00	\$317,300.00	\$840,000.00	No Bid	\$23,500.00	\$32,000.00	\$85,000.00	\$50.00	\$95.00
Mechanical Contractor:	Ivey Mechanical		\$4,522,711.00									
Plumbing Contractor:	Ivey Mechanical		\$1,490,673.00									
Electrical Contractor:	M-R Electric		\$3,258,500.00									
Fire Protection Contractor:	VSC		\$470,000.00									
Site Contractor:	Pike and Paving		\$1,233,555.00									
Monteith Construction Corp.	NO BID											
Mechanical Contractor:	NO BID											
Plumbing Contractor:	NO BID											
Electrical Contractor:	NO BID											
Fire Protection Contractor:	NO BID											
Site Contractor:	NO BID											

Apparent low bidder in in bold